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Following the Reformation, a growing number of radical Protestants came together to live and worship in
Catholic France. These Huguenots survived persecution and armed conflict to win - however briefly -
freedom of worship, civil rights, and unique status as a protected minority. But in 1685, the Revocation of
the Edict of Nantes abolished all Huguenot rights, and more than 200,000 of the radical Calvinists were
forced to flee across Europe, some even farther. In this capstone work, Geoffrey Treasure tells the full story
of the Huguenots' rise, survival and fall in France over the course of a century and a half. He explores what it
was like to be a Huguenot living in a "state within a state", weaving stories of ordinary citizens together with
those of statesmen, feudal magnates, leaders of the Catholic revival, Henry of Navarre, Catherine de' Medici,
Louis XIV, and many others. Treasure describes the Huguenots' disciplined community, their faith and
courage, their rich achievements, and their unique place within Protestantism and European history. The
Huguenot exodus represented a crucial turning point in European history, Treasure contends, and he
addresses the significance of the Huguenot story - the story of a minority group with the power to resist and
endure in one of early modern Europe's strongest nations.
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From reader reviews:

Joe Vizcarra:

The Huguenots can be one of your beginner books that are good idea. We all recommend that straight away
because this reserve has good vocabulary that may increase your knowledge in vocabulary, easy to
understand, bit entertaining but nonetheless delivering the information. The writer giving his/her effort to put
every word into joy arrangement in writing The Huguenots yet doesn't forget the main position, giving the
reader the hottest along with based confirm resource information that maybe you can be certainly one of it.
This great information can certainly drawn you into fresh stage of crucial contemplating.

Pamela Pinkham:

Are you kind of stressful person, only have 10 or 15 minute in your day to upgrading your mind expertise or
thinking skill also analytical thinking? Then you are experiencing problem with the book in comparison with
can satisfy your short space of time to read it because all this time you only find guide that need more time to
be read. The Huguenots can be your answer given it can be read by you actually who have those short spare
time problems.

Robert Young:

Reading a book being new life style in this season; every people loves to examine a book. When you study a
book you can get a wide range of benefit. When you read publications, you can improve your knowledge,
mainly because book has a lot of information in it. The information that you will get depend on what forms
of book that you have read. If you want to get information about your analysis, you can read education
books, but if you want to entertain yourself you are able to a fiction books, such us novel, comics, and also
soon. The The Huguenots provide you with new experience in reading through a book.

Jackie Armstrong:

You can spend your free time you just read this book this e-book. This The Huguenots is simple to bring you
can read it in the playground, in the beach, train and also soon. If you did not get much space to bring the
particular printed book, you can buy the e-book. It is make you easier to read it. You can save the book in
your smart phone. Therefore there are a lot of benefits that you will get when you buy this book.
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