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~This is a contemporary, new adult romance fiction serial.~ What happens when falling madly in love leads
to murder? Tara and Kevin have been best friends for as long as they can remember. When they begin to
develop feelings for each other, their relationship is challenged by more than their internal struggle to hold
onto the friendship. Someone in their circle burns with rage when he learns that the girl he's loved from afar
has developed feelings for another. What begins as a perceived betrayal soon becomes deadly. How this
predator chooses to deal with his jealousy will rock Tara and Kevin’s small town to the core. As Tara and
Kevin continue to nurture the wild flames of their blossoming relationship, a sadistic and virtually
unstoppable force is determined to destroy them and their new found love by any means necessary. Lose
yourself in this thrilling story by purchasing BURNT, The Wild Flames Series, Book 1. Note. This is the first
of three full-length novels in the 3-part serial romance. Sexual content and swearing. 18+. Cliffhanger.
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From reader reviews:

Sandra Gregory:

This Burnt (The Wild Flames Series) (Volume 1) book is not ordinary book, you have it then the world is in
your hands. The benefit you have by reading this book is usually information inside this book incredible
fresh, you will get info which is getting deeper an individual read a lot of information you will get. This kind
of Burnt (The Wild Flames Series) (Volume 1) without we know teach the one who reading it become
critical in considering and analyzing. Don't be worry Burnt (The Wild Flames Series) (Volume 1) can bring
if you are and not make your case space or bookshelves' turn into full because you can have it in the lovely
laptop even mobile phone. This Burnt (The Wild Flames Series) (Volume 1) having good arrangement in
word and layout, so you will not truly feel uninterested in reading.

Karen Bell:

The reserve untitled Burnt (The Wild Flames Series) (Volume 1) is the book that recommended to you to
learn. You can see the quality of the reserve content that will be shown to you. The language that article
author use to explained their way of doing something is easily to understand. The author was did a lot of
exploration when write the book, so the information that they share to your account is absolutely accurate.
You also can get the e-book of Burnt (The Wild Flames Series) (Volume 1) from the publisher to make you
far more enjoy free time.

John Montes:

Beside this Burnt (The Wild Flames Series) (Volume 1) in your phone, it can give you a way to get closer to
the new knowledge or details. The information and the knowledge you might got here is fresh in the oven so
don't be worry if you feel like an aged people live in narrow small town. It is good thing to have Burnt (The
Wild Flames Series) (Volume 1) because this book offers for you readable information. Do you sometimes
have book but you seldom get what it's exactly about. Oh come on, that would not happen if you have this in
the hand. The Enjoyable blend here cannot be questionable, like treasuring beautiful island. So do you still
want to miss it? Find this book in addition to read it from now!

Jeffrey Channell:

This Burnt (The Wild Flames Series) (Volume 1) is brand-new way for you who has intense curiosity to look
for some information mainly because it relief your hunger of knowledge. Getting deeper you into it getting
knowledge more you know or perhaps you who still having tiny amount of digest in reading this Burnt (The
Wild Flames Series) (Volume 1) can be the light food to suit your needs because the information inside this
particular book is easy to get through anyone. These books acquire itself in the form which can be reachable
by anyone, yep I mean in the e-book contact form. People who think that in e-book form make them feel
sleepy even dizzy this reserve is the answer. So there is not any in reading a publication especially this one.
You can find actually looking for. It should be here for anyone. So , don't miss the idea! Just read this e-book
style for your better life along with knowledge.
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