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Our Life Beyond MKULTRA, Books 1 and 2, is an insider's story of intentionally designed trauma-based
mind kontrol Multiple Personality Disorder and her resultant use involving government, military,
intelligence, religious and corporate organizations and institutions, as well as the insidious kontrol of
humanity by a eons old cross-dimensional species involved in hybridization and cloning. The demi-gods and
Nephilim of old have a predominant role in her story, having encountered them repeatedly in the altered
consciousness of trauma-based mind kontrol programming as well as in full waking consciousness. It is a
journey through the mind fragmenting "black tech" being utilized by a bloodline network of human victims
to these malevolent beings who are now its minions and perpetrators. Elisa's is a story of abilities attained
through this process some of which still remain well into her deep deprogramming years which began in
April 2008. Her story takes you through hybridization, cloning and cybernization, though not in the future,
instead already here and successfully implemented in the black projects of high level total mind kontrol.
Elisa contends she is a hybrid, preconception, and in the late 1980s became aware of her clones. What's
more, she speaks to the current state of mind kontrol technology in use as involving not only hybridization
and cloning, but post-birth cybernization and the design of human looking beings who are actually soulless,
and that some already walk among us. Our Life Beyond MKULTRA is contained in 2 Books to provide the
perspective of not only the horrendous programming and "on task" years running decades, but the life
threatening journey that continues in deep deprogramming. Her contention, "once MKULTRA, always
MKULTRA," however the dismantling and manageability of her still surfacing alters and programs has
allowed an intelligent and self-aware evaluation of not only her own situation, yet that of the "next level"
End Time agenda now affecting the globe. If the current intellect continues to demand that all that is surreal
is a judge to falsehoods, then humanity will not extract itself from the impending species kontrol. According
to Elisa and many of her alternate personalities, the "next level" is the total kontrol of the human species
without their recognition that it occurred.
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From reader reviews:

Stephan Stephens:

Now a day individuals who Living in the era exactly where everything reachable by talk with the internet
and the resources inside can be true or not call for people to be aware of each info they get. How individuals
to be smart in having any information nowadays? Of course the answer is reading a book. Looking at a book
can help persons out of this uncertainty Information specifically this Our Life Beyond MKULTRA, Book 2
book since this book offers you rich info and knowledge. Of course the information in this book hundred pct
guarantees there is no doubt in it as you know.

Mary Barker:

The reason why? Because this Our Life Beyond MKULTRA, Book 2 is an unordinary book that the inside of
the reserve waiting for you to snap that but latter it will surprise you with the secret it inside. Reading this
book close to it was fantastic author who write the book in such amazing way makes the content inside easier
to understand, entertaining means but still convey the meaning entirely. So , it is good for you because of not
hesitating having this any longer or you going to regret it. This unique book will give you a lot of advantages
than the other book include such as help improving your skill and your critical thinking approach. So , still
want to hold off having that book? If I were you I will go to the e-book store hurriedly.

Lisa Rice:

Do you have something that that suits you such as book? The guide lovers usually prefer to choose book like
comic, quick story and the biggest the first is novel. Now, why not seeking Our Life Beyond MKULTRA,
Book 2 that give your pleasure preference will be satisfied by reading this book. Reading behavior all over
the world can be said as the means for people to know world considerably better then how they react when it
comes to the world. It can't be claimed constantly that reading addiction only for the geeky individual but for
all of you who wants to end up being success person. So , for all of you who want to start reading as your
good habit, you are able to pick Our Life Beyond MKULTRA, Book 2 become your own personal starter.

Francis Corder:

This Our Life Beyond MKULTRA, Book 2 is brand-new way for you who has attention to look for some
information mainly because it relief your hunger of information. Getting deeper you upon it getting
knowledge more you know or else you who still having little bit of digest in reading this Our Life Beyond
MKULTRA, Book 2 can be the light food for you because the information inside that book is easy to get by
anyone. These books develop itself in the form that is certainly reachable by anyone, yes I mean in the e-
book web form. People who think that in book form make them feel tired even dizzy this guide is the answer.
So there is absolutely no in reading a publication especially this one. You can find what you are looking for.
It should be here for a person. So , don't miss the item! Just read this e-book sort for your better life and
knowledge.
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