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When J. the narrator, George, Harris and Montmorency the dog set off on their hilarious misadventures, they
can hardly predict the troubles that lie ahead with tow-ropes, unreliable weather-forecasts, imaginary
illnesses, butter pats and tins of pineapple chunks. Denounced as vulgar by the literary establishment, Three
Men in a Boat nevertheless caught the spirit of the times. The expansion of education and the increase in
office workers created a new mass readership, and Jerome's book was especially popular among the 'clerking
classes' who longed to be 'free from that fretful haste, that vehement striving, that is every day becoming
more and more the bane of nineteenth-century life.'

So popular did it prove that Jerome reunited his heroes for a bicycle tour of Germany. Despite some sharp,
and with hindsight, prophetic observations of the country, Three Men on the Bummel describes an equally
picaresque journey constrained only 'by the necessity of getting back within a given time to the point from
which one started'.

For more than seventy years, Penguin has been the leading publisher of classic literature in the English-
speaking world. With more than 1,700 titles, Penguin Classics represents a global bookshelf of the best
works throughout history and across genres and disciplines. Readers trust the series to provide authoritative
texts enhanced by introductions and notes by distinguished scholars and contemporary authors, as well as
up-to-date translations by award-winning translators.
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From reader reviews:

Stacey Samuels:

Have you spare time for a day? What do you do when you have more or little spare time? Yes, you can
choose the suitable activity regarding spend your time. Any person spent all their spare time to take a go
walking, shopping, or went to typically the Mall. How about open or maybe read a book titled Three Men in
a Boat and Three Men on the Bummel? Maybe it is to become best activity for you. You already know
beside you can spend your time together with your favorite's book, you can more intelligent than before. Do
you agree with the opinion or you have some other opinion?

Mattie Martin:

Many people spending their moment by playing outside using friends, fun activity using family or just
watching TV 24 hours a day. You can have new activity to enjoy your whole day by looking at a book. Ugh,
think reading a book can definitely hard because you have to take the book everywhere? It ok you can have
the e-book, bringing everywhere you want in your Smart phone. Like Three Men in a Boat and Three Men
on the Bummel which is keeping the e-book version. So , why not try out this book? Let's notice.

Sam Dickson:

Is it you who having spare time in that case spend it whole day by watching television programs or just lying
down on the bed? Do you need something new? This Three Men in a Boat and Three Men on the Bummel
can be the respond to, oh how comes? A book you know. You are therefore out of date, spending your extra
time by reading in this completely new era is common not a nerd activity. So what these guides have than the
others?

Deborah Fishman:

Many people said that they feel fed up when they reading a publication. They are directly felt the item when
they get a half parts of the book. You can choose often the book Three Men in a Boat and Three Men on the
Bummel to make your current reading is interesting. Your current skill of reading ability is developing when
you just like reading. Try to choose very simple book to make you enjoy to study it and mingle the opinion
about book and reading through especially. It is to be initial opinion for you to like to open up a book and
examine it. Beside that the e-book Three Men in a Boat and Three Men on the Bummel can to be your new
friend when you're sense alone and confuse with what must you're doing of the time.
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