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Here is, to quote the eminent historian Nathan Irvin Huggins, “one of the finest American autobiographies
written in this century.” Born in 1871 in Jacksonville, Florida, James Weldon Johnson began his career as a
high-school principal. He went on to attain success as a songwriter on Broadway and as the compiler of the
definitive Book of American Negro Spirituals. But he achieved one of his greatest triumphs in 1912, when,
under a pseudonym, he published The Autobiography of an Ex-Colored Man—a classic novel about a
musician who rejects his black roots, a novel that is still in print today in multiple paperback editions.
Johnson went on to be, from 1920 to 1930, the first African-American head of the NAACP, fighting
tirelessly for the passage of a federal anti-lynching law. His life story is that of a truly remarkable man who
triumphed over a system of institutionalized racism to become one of black America’s leading educators,
men of letters, and reformers.
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From reader reviews:

Florence Whitney:

Nowadays reading books become more and more than want or need but also get a life style. This reading
practice give you lot of advantages. Associate programs you got of course the knowledge your information
inside the book that improve your knowledge and information. The information you get based on what kind
of reserve you read, if you want get more knowledge just go with training books but if you want truly feel
happy read one along with theme for entertaining including comic or novel. The particular Along This Way:
The Autobiography Of James Weldon Johnson is kind of reserve which is giving the reader capricious
experience.

Anthony Rodriguez:

Many people spending their period by playing outside having friends, fun activity using family or just
watching TV all day every day. You can have new activity to shell out your whole day by examining a book.
Ugh, do you think reading a book can definitely hard because you have to take the book everywhere? It fine
you can have the e-book, delivering everywhere you want in your Smart phone. Like Along This Way: The
Autobiography Of James Weldon Johnson which is finding the e-book version. So , why not try out this
book? Let's notice.

Adeline Norris:

Is it anyone who having spare time then spend it whole day through watching television programs or just
resting on the bed? Do you need something totally new? This Along This Way: The Autobiography Of
James Weldon Johnson can be the solution, oh how comes? A fresh book you know. You are consequently
out of date, spending your free time by reading in this fresh era is common not a geek activity. So what these
publications have than the others?

Nancy Soto:

Don't be worry for anyone who is afraid that this book can filled the space in your house, you will get it in e-
book means, more simple and reachable. This particular Along This Way: The Autobiography Of James
Weldon Johnson can give you a lot of close friends because by you checking out this one book you have
matter that they don't and make a person more like an interesting person. This specific book can be one of
one step for you to get success. This e-book offer you information that perhaps your friend doesn't know, by
knowing more than additional make you to be great men and women. So , why hesitate? Let me have Along
This Way: The Autobiography Of James Weldon Johnson.
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