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On the right side of the law. Sort of.
 
Sebastian Rudd is not your typical street lawyer. He works out of a customized bulletproof van, complete
with Wi-Fi, a bar, a small fridge, fine leather chairs, a hidden gun compartment, and a heavily armed driver.
He has no firm, no partners, no associates, and only one employee, his driver, who’s also his bodyguard, law
clerk, confidant, and golf caddy. He lives alone in a small but extremely safe penthouse apartment, and his
primary piece of furniture is a vintage pool table. He drinks small-batch bourbon and carries a gun.
 
Sebastian defends people other lawyers won’t go near: a drug-addled, tattooed kid rumored to be in a satanic
cult, who is accused of molesting and murdering two little girls; a vicious crime lord on death row; a
homeowner arrested for shooting at a SWAT team that mistakenly invaded his house.  Why these clients?
Because he believes everyone is entitled to a fair trial, even if he, Sebastian, has to cheat to secure one. He
hates injustice, doesn’t like insurance companies, banks, or big corporations; he distrusts all levels of
government and laughs at the justice system’s notions of ethical behavior.
 
Sebastian Rudd is one of John Grisham’s most colorful, outrageous, and vividly drawn characters yet. Gritty,
witty, and impossible to put down, Rogue Lawyer showcases the master of the legal thriller at his very best.
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From reader reviews:

Todd Jacob:

What do you consider book? It is just for students because they are still students or it for all people in the
world, the actual best subject for that? Just you can be answered for that problem above. Every person has
different personality and hobby for each and every other. Don't to be pressured someone or something that
they don't desire do that. You must know how great as well as important the book Rogue Lawyer. All type of
book is it possible to see on many sources. You can look for the internet options or other social media.

Helen Samuel:

Reading can called brain hangout, why? Because if you are reading a book mainly book entitled Rogue
Lawyer the mind will drift away trough every dimension, wandering in each aspect that maybe mysterious
for but surely will become your mind friends. Imaging each word written in a publication then become one
contact form conclusion and explanation that maybe you never get before. The Rogue Lawyer giving you an
additional experience more than blown away your mind but also giving you useful facts for your better life in
this era. So now let us teach you the relaxing pattern is your body and mind is going to be pleased when you
are finished reading through it, like winning a. Do you want to try this extraordinary spending spare time
activity?

Donald Labelle:

In this era which is the greater particular person or who has ability in doing something more are more
important than other. Do you want to become certainly one of it? It is just simple way to have that. What you
should do is just spending your time almost no but quite enough to possess a look at some books. One of
several books in the top listing in your reading list is actually Rogue Lawyer. This book which can be
qualified as The Hungry Slopes can get you closer in becoming precious person. By looking upward and
review this guide you can get many advantages.

Fred Prentice:

As a scholar exactly feel bored to reading. If their teacher questioned them to go to the library in order to
make summary for some book, they are complained. Just minor students that has reading's heart and soul or
real their hobby. They just do what the teacher want, like asked to the library. They go to there but nothing
reading significantly. Any students feel that looking at is not important, boring along with can't see colorful
pics on there. Yeah, it is to get complicated. Book is very important for yourself. As we know that on this
period, many ways to get whatever we want. Likewise word says, many ways to reach Chinese's country. So
, this Rogue Lawyer can make you truly feel more interested to read.
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