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Since the 1980s, economists have used the concept of strategic trade policy, which takes account of
imperfect competition and increasing returns in the international marketplace, to criticize conventional views
about free trade. According to the new view, a government can take strategic steps to raise its income at
another country's expense—by subsidizing exports or erecting trade barriers, protecting certain firms from
foreign competition, or promoting the development of new industries. This volume looks at the experience of
specific industries in order to determine the effectiveness of strategic trade policy in promoting economic
growth.

The nine papers cover the U.S. and European auto industries, the U.S. steel industry, the commercial aircraft
industry, airline deregulation in Scandinavia, and labor and industrial policy in Korea and Taiwan. The
authors refine the basic techniques for measuring policy effectiveness, extend them to encompass industry
dynamics, and test the implications of new trade models.

International economists and trade experts in government and business will find important new insights into
the role of strategic trade policy in international competitiveness.
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From reader reviews:

Vicki Shah:

This Empirical Studies of Strategic Trade Policy (National Bureau of Economic Research Project Report)
tend to be reliable for you who want to be a successful person, why. The main reason of this Empirical
Studies of Strategic Trade Policy (National Bureau of Economic Research Project Report) can be among the
great books you must have is giving you more than just simple looking at food but feed you with information
that might be will shock your preceding knowledge. This book is definitely handy, you can bring it just about
everywhere and whenever your conditions throughout the e-book and printed kinds. Beside that this
Empirical Studies of Strategic Trade Policy (National Bureau of Economic Research Project Report) forcing
you to have an enormous of experience like rich vocabulary, giving you test of critical thinking that we all
know it useful in your day task. So , let's have it and enjoy reading.

Clarence Liller:

This book untitled Empirical Studies of Strategic Trade Policy (National Bureau of Economic Research
Project Report) to be one of several books which best seller in this year, that is because when you read this
guide you can get a lot of benefit into it. You will easily to buy this particular book in the book store or you
can order it via online. The publisher of this book sells the e-book too. It makes you easier to read this book,
since you can read this book in your Mobile phone. So there is no reason for your requirements to past this
reserve from your list.

Mildred Hall:

The guide untitled Empirical Studies of Strategic Trade Policy (National Bureau of Economic Research
Project Report) is the e-book that recommended to you to see. You can see the quality of the book content
that will be shown to you actually. The language that creator use to explained their way of doing something
is easily to understand. The author was did a lot of research when write the book, to ensure the information
that they share for your requirements is absolutely accurate. You also could possibly get the e-book of
Empirical Studies of Strategic Trade Policy (National Bureau of Economic Research Project Report) from
the publisher to make you far more enjoy free time.

Frank Foushee:

Is it a person who having spare time subsequently spend it whole day simply by watching television
programs or just lying on the bed? Do you need something new? This Empirical Studies of Strategic Trade
Policy (National Bureau of Economic Research Project Report) can be the answer, oh how comes? It's a
book you know. You are therefore out of date, spending your free time by reading in this new era is common
not a geek activity. So what these ebooks have than the others?
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