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Location-Based Services Handbook: Applications, Technologies, and Security is a comprehensive
reference containing all aspects of essential technical information on location-based services (LBS)
technology. With broad coverage ranging from basic concepts to research-grade material, it presents a much-
needed overview of technologies for positioning and localizing, including range- and proximity-based
localization methods, and environment-based location estimation methods. Featuring valuable contributions
from field experts around the world, this book addresses existing and future directions of LBS technology,
exploring how it can be used to optimize resource allocation and improve cooperation in wireless networks.

It is a self-contained, comprehensive resource that presents:

A detailed description of the wireless location positioning technology used in LBS●

Coverage of the privacy and protection procedure for cellular networks?and its shortcomings●

An assessment of threats presented when location information is divulged to unauthorized parties●

Important IP Multimedia Subsystem and IMS-based presence service proposals●

The demand for navigation services is predicted to rise by a combined annual growth rate of more than 104
percent between 2008 and 2012, and many of these applications require efficient and highly scalable system
architecture and system services to support dissemination of location-dependent resources and information to
a large and growing number of mobile users.

This book offers tools to aid in determining the optimal distance measurement system for a given situation
by assessing factors including complexity, accuracy, and environment. It provides an extensive survey of
existing literature and proposes a novel, widely applicable, and highly scalable architecture solution.
Organized into three major sections?applications, technologies, and security?this material fully covers
various location-based applications and the impact they will have on the future.
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From reader reviews:

Kurt Hooper:

What do you regarding book? It is not important to you? Or just adding material when you want something
to explain what the one you have problem? How about your free time? Or are you busy particular person? If
you don't have spare time to perform others business, it is gives you the sense of being bored faster. And you
have free time? What did you do? Every person has many questions above. They need to answer that
question due to the fact just their can do this. It said that about guide. Book is familiar on every person. Yes,
it is correct. Because start from on kindergarten until university need that Location-Based Services
Handbook: Applications, Technologies, and Security to read.

Scarlet Rome:

Often the book Location-Based Services Handbook: Applications, Technologies, and Security has a lot info
on it. So when you read this book you can get a lot of advantage. The book was authored by the very famous
author. This articles author makes some research prior to write this book. This book very easy to read you
can get the point easily after reading this book.

Margaret Parker:

Reading can called mind hangout, why? Because while you are reading a book specially book entitled
Location-Based Services Handbook: Applications, Technologies, and Security your head will drift away
trough every dimension, wandering in every single aspect that maybe unknown for but surely can be your
mind friends. Imaging every single word written in a guide then become one contact form conclusion and
explanation that will maybe you never get previous to. The Location-Based Services Handbook:
Applications, Technologies, and Security giving you an additional experience more than blown away your
thoughts but also giving you useful information for your better life in this particular era. So now let us
explain to you the relaxing pattern the following is your body and mind are going to be pleased when you are
finished looking at it, like winning a game. Do you want to try this extraordinary spending spare time
activity?

Mary Barnett:

Do you have something that that suits you such as book? The e-book lovers usually prefer to choose book
like comic, short story and the biggest one is novel. Now, why not trying Location-Based Services
Handbook: Applications, Technologies, and Security that give your entertainment preference will be
satisfied by means of reading this book. Reading habit all over the world can be said as the means for people
to know world much better then how they react to the world. It can't be claimed constantly that reading
routine only for the geeky man but for all of you who wants to be success person. So , for all you who want
to start reading through as your good habit, you may pick Location-Based Services Handbook: Applications,
Technologies, and Security become your starter.
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