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of the original book (without typos) from the publisher. Not indexed. Not illustrated. 1909 Excerpt: ...to
contract with the Albany Penitentiary for the custody and employment at hard.labor of persons convicted
within this county and sentenced to imprisonment in the county jail for term exceeding sixty days at an
expense not to exceed $2.00 per week for each person was amended so as to read. "At an expense not
exceeding $2.25 per week for each person." On motion adjourned to Monday December 7th, 1908 at 1:30 P.
M. TWKIiFTH DAY. Monday Dec. 7th, 1908, 1:30 P. M. Board met pursuant to adjournment. Chairman
Boomhower presiding. All the members present. Minutes of Friday Dec. 4th read and approved. On motion
of Mr. Burke the resolution authorizing the levy of $2,925.00 on the taxable property of the town of Saranac
was adopted. On motion of Mr. Lawson the report of the Committee on Sheriff's accounts was adopted and
the amounts thereof levied upon the county for the year 1908. Committee work and work on rolls. Adjourned
at 5 P. M. until 7:30 P. M. 7:30 P. M. Board reconvened. All the members present. Chairman Boomhower
presiding. STATE OF NEW YORK, Comptroller's Office, Albany, December 6, 1908. Mr. A. E. LaMarche,
Clerk Board Supervisors, Clinton Co., Plattsburgh, N. Y. Dear Sir:---Replying to yours of the 2d inst, this
department would say that in the statement to be transmitted by you to the Comptroller and the highway
commission, pursuant to section 100 of the highway law, (chapter 330, laws of 1908), you should give the
1908 equalization and not that of 1907. This section 100 should be read in connection with section 102
which'does not go into effect until January 1, 1909. In determining the amounts to be paid the towns, the
Comptroller must act under the law now in force (chapter 716, laws of 1907) and in making our
computations it will be necessa...
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From reader reviews:

Ruby Sprankle:

This Proceedings of the Board of Supervisors, County of Clinton tend to be reliable for you who want to be
described as a successful person, why. The explanation of this Proceedings of the Board of Supervisors,
County of Clinton can be one of several great books you must have is definitely giving you more than just
simple reading through food but feed you with information that might be will shock your earlier knowledge.
This book is definitely handy, you can bring it everywhere you go and whenever your conditions both in e-
book and printed types. Beside that this Proceedings of the Board of Supervisors, County of Clinton forcing
you to have an enormous of experience for example rich vocabulary, giving you trial run of critical thinking
that we know it useful in your day activity. So , let's have it and revel in reading.

Reva Morison:

A lot of people always spent their own free time to vacation or even go to the outside with them friends and
family or their friend. Do you realize? Many a lot of people spent these people free time just watching TV, or
maybe playing video games all day long. If you would like try to find a new activity here is look different
you can read any book. It is really fun in your case. If you enjoy the book which you read you can spent all
day every day to reading a publication. The book Proceedings of the Board of Supervisors, County of
Clinton it is rather good to read. There are a lot of those who recommended this book. We were holding
enjoying reading this book. In the event you did not have enough space to bring this book you can buy
typically the e-book. You can m0ore effortlessly to read this book from a smart phone. The price is not to
cover but this book has high quality.

Ricky Dotson:

Do you like reading a guide? Confuse to looking for your best book? Or your book seemed to be rare? Why
so many question for the book? But any kind of people feel that they enjoy for reading. Some people likes
reading, not only science book but additionally novel and Proceedings of the Board of Supervisors, County
of Clinton or maybe others sources were given understanding for you. After you know how the truly great a
book, you feel wish to read more and more. Science reserve was created for teacher or maybe students
especially. Those guides are helping them to bring their knowledge. In some other case, beside science
guide, any other book likes Proceedings of the Board of Supervisors, County of Clinton to make your spare
time much more colorful. Many types of book like this one.

Eric Valentine:

Many people said that they feel fed up when they reading a e-book. They are directly felt the item when they
get a half elements of the book. You can choose the book Proceedings of the Board of Supervisors, County
of Clinton to make your own personal reading is interesting. Your own skill of reading ability is developing
when you such as reading. Try to choose very simple book to make you enjoy you just read it and mingle the



opinion about book and looking at especially. It is to be 1st opinion for you to like to open up a book and go
through it. Beside that the publication Proceedings of the Board of Supervisors, County of Clinton can to be
your new friend when you're really feel alone and confuse in what must you're doing of these time.
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