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Urban history is a well-established and flourishing field of historical research. Written by a leading scholar,
this short introduction demonstrates how urban history draws upon a wide variety of methodologies and
sources, and has been integral to the rise of interdisciplinary and comparative approaches to history since the
second half of the twentieth century. Shane Ewen offers an accessible and clearly written guide to the study
of urban history for the student, teacher, researcher or general reader who is new to the field and interested in
learning about past approaches as well as key themes, concepts and trajectories for future research. He takes
a global and comparative viewpoint, combining a discussion of classic texts with the latest literature to
illustrate the current debates and controversies across the urban world. The historiography of the field is
mapped out by theme, including new topics of interest, with a particular focus on space and social identity,
power and governance, the built environment, culture and modernity, and the growth and spread of
transnational networking.

By discussing a number of historic and fast-growing cities across the world, What is Urban History?
demonstrates the importance of the history of urban life to our understanding of the world, both in the
present and the future. As a result, urban history remains pivotal for explaining the continued growth of
towns and cities in a global context, and is particularly useful for identifying the various problems and
solutions faced by fast-growing megacities in the developing world.
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From reader reviews:

Jonathan Head:

What do you ponder on book? It is just for students because they're still students or it for all people in the
world, the particular best subject for that? Just simply you can be answered for that concern above. Every
person has different personality and hobby for every single other. Don't to be forced someone or something
that they don't desire do that. You must know how great and also important the book What is Urban History
(What is History series). All type of book would you see on many methods. You can look for the internet
methods or other social media.

Jocelyn Welch:

Now a day folks who Living in the era exactly where everything reachable by connect with the internet and
the resources within it can be true or not call for people to be aware of each data they get. How many people
to be smart in having any information nowadays? Of course the solution is reading a book. Examining a
book can help folks out of this uncertainty Information especially this What is Urban History (What is
History series) book because this book offers you rich details and knowledge. Of course the knowledge in
this book hundred per cent guarantees there is no doubt in it you probably know this.

James Vazquez:

Reading a book can be one of a lot of pastime that everyone in the world enjoys. Do you like reading book
thus. There are a lot of reasons why people enjoy it. First reading a book will give you a lot of new
information. When you read a publication you will get new information simply because book is one of a
number of ways to share the information or even their idea. Second, reading through a book will make a
person more imaginative. When you reading a book especially fictional works book the author will bring one
to imagine the story how the character types do it anything. Third, you may share your knowledge to other
individuals. When you read this What is Urban History (What is History series), you could tells your family,
friends along with soon about yours reserve. Your knowledge can inspire others, make them reading a e-
book.

Beth Call:

The publication untitled What is Urban History (What is History series) is the publication that recommended
to you to read. You can see the quality of the e-book content that will be shown to a person. The language
that creator use to explained their way of doing something is easily to understand. The writer was did a lot of
analysis when write the book, therefore the information that they share for you is absolutely accurate. You
also might get the e-book of What is Urban History (What is History series) from the publisher to make you
considerably more enjoy free time.
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