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Speaking up for yourself has benefits, but it has costs, too. Many people who struggle with assertiveness are
paralyzed by worries that they’ll seem mean, petty, or that they will hurt the other person’s feelings. Even
though they want to speak up, they may keep their true needs and opinions to themselves because of these
fears—eventually building stress, resentment, and alienation. The Guide to Compassionate Assertiveness
does not require that readers ignore the needs of others and focus solely on their own desires. Rather, this
unique blend of cognitive behavioral therapy-based assertiveness training and Buddhist psychology helps
readers practice assertiveness skills while caring deeply about the welfare of others.

This book helps readers develop a form of assertiveness that emphasizes collaboration, negotiation, and
compromise. It focuses on speaking up for the benefit of others and speaking up for the relationship, not just
one’s own needs. In this way, readers learn to assert their needs in ways that match their compassionate
value systems. This book is the ideal assertiveness guide for those who are afraid of rejection, have a deep
concern for how others perceive them, often feel judged by others, or have difficulty expressing their
feelings and needs. Readers learn to apply assertiveness skills in all domains of their lives, including in
romantic relationships, as parents, at work, and in social settings.
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From reader reviews:

Jared Smith:

Now a day folks who Living in the era everywhere everything reachable by connect with the internet and the
resources inside it can be true or not involve people to be aware of each data they get. How people have to be
smart in obtaining any information nowadays? Of course the reply is reading a book. Reading through a
book can help people out of this uncertainty Information especially this The Guide to Compassionate
Assertiveness: How to Express Your Needs and Deal with Conflict While Keeping a Kind Heart book
because this book offers you rich data and knowledge. Of course the details in this book hundred per-cent
guarantees there is no doubt in it you know.

Shawn Proctor:

Do you have something that that suits you such as book? The reserve lovers usually prefer to choose book
like comic, limited story and the biggest you are novel. Now, why not hoping The Guide to Compassionate
Assertiveness: How to Express Your Needs and Deal with Conflict While Keeping a Kind Heart that give
your satisfaction preference will be satisfied by reading this book. Reading routine all over the world can be
said as the opportunity for people to know world considerably better then how they react towards the world.
It can't be explained constantly that reading routine only for the geeky particular person but for all of you
who wants to end up being success person. So , for all of you who want to start looking at as your good
habit, you can pick The Guide to Compassionate Assertiveness: How to Express Your Needs and Deal with
Conflict While Keeping a Kind Heart become your own personal starter.

Tammara Dejesus:

This The Guide to Compassionate Assertiveness: How to Express Your Needs and Deal with Conflict While
Keeping a Kind Heart is great book for you because the content which is full of information for you who else
always deal with world and have to make decision every minute. This particular book reveal it info
accurately using great arrange word or we can point out no rambling sentences within it. So if you are read
the item hurriedly you can have whole data in it. Doesn't mean it only provides straight forward sentences
but tricky core information with lovely delivering sentences. Having The Guide to Compassionate
Assertiveness: How to Express Your Needs and Deal with Conflict While Keeping a Kind Heart in your
hand like getting the world in your arm, information in it is not ridiculous a single. We can say that no
publication that offer you world throughout ten or fifteen minute right but this reserve already do that. So ,
this really is good reading book. Hello Mr. and Mrs. active do you still doubt that will?

Nicholas Buchanan:

Do you like reading a e-book? Confuse to looking for your selected book? Or your book has been rare? Why
so many query for the book? But just about any people feel that they enjoy intended for reading. Some
people likes reading, not only science book but also novel and The Guide to Compassionate Assertiveness:



How to Express Your Needs and Deal with Conflict While Keeping a Kind Heart or others sources were
given understanding for you. After you know how the truly great a book, you feel wish to read more and
more. Science e-book was created for teacher or maybe students especially. Those textbooks are helping
them to put their knowledge. In additional case, beside science publication, any other book likes The Guide
to Compassionate Assertiveness: How to Express Your Needs and Deal with Conflict While Keeping a Kind
Heart to make your spare time more colorful. Many types of book like here.
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