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The #1 New York Times bestselling memoir that inspired the film October Sky, Rocket Boys is a uniquely
American memoir—a powerful, luminous story of coming of age at the dawn of the 1960s, of a mother's
love and a father's fears, of a group of young men who dreamed of launching rockets into outer space . . . and
who made those dreams come true.

With the grace of a natural storyteller, NASA engineer Homer Hickam paints a warm, vivid portrait of the
harsh West Virginia mining town of his youth, evoking a time of innocence and promise, when anything was
possible, even in a company town that swallowed its men alive. A story of romance and loss, of growing up
and getting out, Homer Hickam's lush, lyrical memoir is a chronicle of triumph—at once exquisitely written
and marvelously entertaining.

Now with 8 pages of photographs.

A number-one New York Times bestseller in mass market, brought to the screen in the acclaimed film
October Sky, Homer Hickam's memoir, nominated for the National Book Critics Circle Award, comes to
trade paperback with an all-new photo insert.

One of the most beloved bestsellers in recent years, Rocket Boys is a uniquely American memoir. A
powerful, luminous story of coming of age at the end of the 1950s, it is the story of a mother's love and a
father's fears, of growing up and getting out. With the grace of a natural storyteller, Homer Hickam looks
back after a distinguished NASA career to tell his own true story of growing up in a dying coal town and of
how, against the odds, he made his dreams of launching rockets into outer space come true.

A story of romance and loss and a keen portrait of life at an extraordinary point in American history, Rocket
Boys is a chronicle of triumph.
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From reader reviews:

Steven Bemis:

Have you spare time for any day? What do you do when you have more or little spare time? Sure, you can
choose the suitable activity to get spend your time. Any person spent all their spare time to take a wander,
shopping, or went to the Mall. How about open or even read a book called Rocket Boys (The Coalwood
Series #1)? Maybe it is to be best activity for you. You recognize beside you can spend your time along with
your favorite's book, you can better than before. Do you agree with their opinion or you have additional
opinion?

Joshua Smith:

Nowadays reading books are more than want or need but also get a life style. This reading routine give you
lot of advantages. Associate programs you got of course the knowledge your information inside the book this
improve your knowledge and information. The details you get based on what kind of reserve you read, if you
want get more knowledge just go with training books but if you want truly feel happy read one with theme
for entertaining like comic or novel. The Rocket Boys (The Coalwood Series #1) is kind of reserve which is
giving the reader unstable experience.

John Thornton:

The publication untitled Rocket Boys (The Coalwood Series #1) is the e-book that recommended to you to
see. You can see the quality of the book content that will be shown to you actually. The language that
publisher use to explained their ideas are easily to understand. The writer was did a lot of exploration when
write the book, so the information that they share to you personally is absolutely accurate. You also could get
the e-book of Rocket Boys (The Coalwood Series #1) from the publisher to make you much more enjoy free
time.

Dana Barker:

This Rocket Boys (The Coalwood Series #1) is great e-book for you because the content which can be full of
information for you who also always deal with world and have to make decision every minute. This specific
book reveal it facts accurately using great plan word or we can claim no rambling sentences inside it. So if
you are read that hurriedly you can have whole data in it. Doesn't mean it only gives you straight forward
sentences but difficult core information with splendid delivering sentences. Having Rocket Boys (The
Coalwood Series #1) in your hand like finding the world in your arm, info in it is not ridiculous one. We can
say that no reserve that offer you world within ten or fifteen second right but this book already do that. So ,
this is good reading book. Hello Mr. and Mrs. occupied do you still doubt that will?
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