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“A wonderfully rich collection of ideas, information, and resources ... walks you through types of potential
careers, the pros and cons of those career choices, and the knowledge and experience you’ll need to
succeed.”
— Kim Dority, from the Foreword

As the global information economy grows, librarians who are able to retool and transfer their skills are
finding themselves increasingly in demand. In What’s the Alternative? Rachel Singer Gordon explains the
dynamics of the shifting market for information-based work, reveals a range of nontraditional employment
opportunities for librarians, and encourages info pros to utilize their skills in new and exciting ways. Mixing
practical advice with real-life stories of librarians working in various fields, Gordon provides a wealth of
useful ideas and resources for info pros rethinking their career paths. Whether you’re a recent library school
grad facing a tight job market, a working librarian seeking improved work/life balance, or an info pro with
an entrepreneurial streak, What’s the Alternative? will help you explore your options and maximize your
career potential.

“In What’s the Alternative? Rachel Singer Gordon proves that the library profession is as broad and
expansive as one’s imagination and goals. A well written and timely book for the information professional at
any career level.”
— Steven M. Cohen, Senior Librarian, Law Library Management, Incorporated

“If you are looking for alternate career paths to take with your MLS, Gordon not only discusses the
destinations, but tells you how to get there and be successful. Indispensable!”
— Michelle Boule, Geek Librarian and blogger, A Wandering Eyre
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From reader reviews:

Robert Hollinger:

Book is actually written, printed, or created for everything. You can recognize everything you want by a
reserve. Book has a different type. As it is known to us that book is important factor to bring us around the
world. Beside that you can your reading ability was fluently. A guide What's the Alternative?: Career
Options for Librarians and Info Pros will make you to possibly be smarter. You can feel a lot more
confidence if you can know about every thing. But some of you think that will open or reading a book make
you bored. It is not necessarily make you fun. Why they are often thought like that? Have you looking for
best book or appropriate book with you?

Joseph Gee:

Typically the book What's the Alternative?: Career Options for Librarians and Info Pros has a lot details on
it. So when you check out this book you can get a lot of help. The book was authored by the very famous
author. This articles author makes some research ahead of write this book. This specific book very easy to
read you can find the point easily after looking over this book.

Steven Kilgore:

What's the Alternative?: Career Options for Librarians and Info Pros can be one of your beginning books that
are good idea. We recommend that straight away because this book has good vocabulary that will increase
your knowledge in vocabulary, easy to understand, bit entertaining however delivering the information. The
author giving his/her effort to set every word into pleasure arrangement in writing What's the Alternative?:
Career Options for Librarians and Info Pros yet doesn't forget the main stage, giving the reader the hottest
and also based confirm resource data that maybe you can be certainly one of it. This great information can
easily drawn you into fresh stage of crucial considering.

Agnes Figueroa:

In this time globalization it is important to someone to get information. The information will make a
professional understand the condition of the world. The health of the world makes the information simpler to
share. You can find a lot of personal references to get information example: internet, newspaper, book, and
soon. You will observe that now, a lot of publisher this print many kinds of book. The actual book that
recommended for your requirements is What's the Alternative?: Career Options for Librarians and Info Pros
this e-book consist a lot of the information from the condition of this world now. This particular book was
represented so why is the world has grown up. The terminology styles that writer value to explain it is easy
to understand. Often the writer made some study when he makes this book. That is why this book suitable all
of you.
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