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From foundation to finish, a wealth of information is available on sustainable construction methods—entire
volumes have been published on individual green and natural building techniques. But with so many
different ideas to choose from, there is no single resource that allows an owner or builder to quickly and
objectively compare the merits of each system for their particular project.

Making Better Buildings cuts through the hype and provides the unvarnished facts about the upsides and
downsides of the most widely discussed materials and technologies. Drawing on the real-world experiences
of designer/builders, this comparative guide systematically and comprehensively examines each approach in
terms of:

Cost, sourcing, availability, labor intensity, and ease of construction●

Energy efficiency, embodied energy, and environmental impacts●

Availability/accessibility●

Each chapter is rounded out by a chart which summarizes the material in a quick and accessible manner.

Whether you are an owner preparing to build a green or natural home or a conventional contractor
determined to integrate sustainable alternatives into your existing construction practices, this up-to-the
minute resource will help you make the best decisions for your project while meeting your energy,
efficiency, budgetary, and site-specific needs.

Chris Magwood and Jen Feigin are sustainable builders and designers specializing in green and natural
building techniques, and are the founders and directors of the Endeavour Centre for Innovative Building and
Living. Chris is also the author of three previous books on sustainable building, including Straw Bale Details
and More Straw Bale Building.
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From reader reviews:

Angela Hampton:

Nowadays reading books become more than want or need but also work as a life style. This reading practice
give you lot of advantages. The advantages you got of course the knowledge the rest of the information
inside the book in which improve your knowledge and information. The data you get based on what kind of
reserve you read, if you want have more knowledge just go with schooling books but if you want truly feel
happy read one together with theme for entertaining for example comic or novel. The Making Better
Buildings: A Comparative Guide to Sustainable Construction for Homeowners and Contractors is kind of e-
book which is giving the reader unpredictable experience.

Irma Hughes:

Hey guys, do you desires to finds a new book to read? May be the book with the subject Making Better
Buildings: A Comparative Guide to Sustainable Construction for Homeowners and Contractors suitable to
you? Typically the book was written by well known writer in this era. The particular book untitled Making
Better Buildings: A Comparative Guide to Sustainable Construction for Homeowners and Contractorsis the
main of several books that will everyone read now. This kind of book was inspired lots of people in the
world. When you read this reserve you will enter the new dimension that you ever know just before. The
author explained their thought in the simple way, and so all of people can easily to comprehend the core of
this guide. This book will give you a great deal of information about this world now. To help you see the
represented of the world in this particular book.

Steven Strong:

People live in this new moment of lifestyle always try and and must have the extra time or they will get great
deal of stress from both lifestyle and work. So , whenever we ask do people have spare time, we will say
absolutely without a doubt. People is human not only a robot. Then we consult again, what kind of activity
do you have when the spare time coming to you of course your answer will unlimited right. Then do you
ever try this one, reading books. It can be your alternative with spending your spare time, the book you have
read is usually Making Better Buildings: A Comparative Guide to Sustainable Construction for Homeowners
and Contractors.

Deborah Fishman:

Reserve is one of source of know-how. We can add our information from it. Not only for students but also
native or citizen will need book to know the upgrade information of year to help year. As we know those
guides have many advantages. Beside most of us add our knowledge, can also bring us to around the world.
By book Making Better Buildings: A Comparative Guide to Sustainable Construction for Homeowners and
Contractors we can take more advantage. Don't you to definitely be creative people? For being creative
person must want to read a book. Only choose the best book that ideal with your aim. Don't always be doubt



to change your life by this book Making Better Buildings: A Comparative Guide to Sustainable Construction
for Homeowners and Contractors. You can more appealing than now.
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