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Scalable Vector Graphics -- or SVG -- is the new XML-based graphics standard from the W3C that will
enable Web documents to be smaller, faster and more interactive. J. David Eisenberg's insightful book takes
you through the ins and outs of SVG, beginning with basics needed to create simple line drawings and then
moving through more complicated features like filters, transformations, and integration with Java, Perl, and
XSLT.

Unlike GIFs, JPEGs or PNGs (which are bitmapped), SVG images are both resolution- and device-
independent, so that they can scale up or down to fit proportionally into any size display or any Internet
device -- from PDAs to large office monitors and high-resolution printers. Smaller than bitmapped files and
faster to download, SVG images can be rendered with different CSS styles for each environment. They work
well across a range of available bandwidths.

SVG makes it possible for designers to escape the constant need to update graphics by hand or use custom
code to generate bitmap images. And while SVG was created with the Web in mind, the language has a
variety of other uses. SVG greatly simplifies tasks like:

Creating web sites whose graphics reflect the content of the page, changing automatically if the content1.
changes
Generating graphs and charts from information stored in a wide variety of sources2.
Exchanging detailed drawings, from architectural plans to CAD layouts to project management diagrams3.
Creating diagrams that users can explore by zooming in and panning around4.
Generating bitmap images for use in older browsers using simple automatable templates5.
Managing graphics that support multiple languages or translations6.
Creating complex animation7.

By focusing sharply on the markup at the foundation of SVG, SVG Essentials gives you a solid base on
which to create your own custom tools. Explanations of key technical tools -- like XML, matrix math, and
scripting -- are included as appendices, along with a reference to the SVG vocabulary.

Whether you're a graphic designer in search of new tools or a programmer dealing with the complex task of
creating and managing graphics, SVG Essentials provides you with the means to take advantage of SVG.
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From reader reviews:

Frances Temple:

What do you in relation to book? It is not important along with you? Or just adding material when you really
need something to explain what yours problem? How about your extra time? Or are you busy individual? If
you don't have spare time to complete others business, it is gives you the sense of being bored faster. And
you have time? What did you do? Everyone has many questions above. They must answer that question
because just their can do this. It said that about book. Book is familiar in each person. Yes, it is proper.
Because start from on pre-school until university need that SVG Essentials (O'Reilly XML) to read.

Bruce Butera:

Spent a free a chance to be fun activity to perform! A lot of people spent their sparetime with their family, or
all their friends. Usually they accomplishing activity like watching television, planning to beach, or picnic
inside the park. They actually doing same thing every week. Do you feel it? Would you like to something
different to fill your own free time/ holiday? Could possibly be reading a book is usually option to fill your
no cost time/ holiday. The first thing you ask may be what kinds of book that you should read. If you want to
try out look for book, may be the publication untitled SVG Essentials (O'Reilly XML) can be fine book to
read. May be it may be best activity to you.

Robert Bartlett:

The book untitled SVG Essentials (O'Reilly XML) contain a lot of information on that. The writer explains
the girl idea with easy method. The language is very straightforward all the people, so do not worry, you can
easy to read the item. The book was written by famous author. The author provides you in the new time of
literary works. It is easy to read this book because you can continue reading your smart phone, or program,
so you can read the book within anywhere and anytime. In a situation you wish to purchase the e-book, you
can available their official web-site in addition to order it. Have a nice learn.

Darryl Payton:

In this era globalization it is important to someone to obtain information. The information will make anyone
to understand the condition of the world. The condition of the world makes the information simpler to share.
You can find a lot of sources to get information example: internet, classifieds, book, and soon. You will see
that now, a lot of publisher in which print many kinds of book. The book that recommended to your account
is SVG Essentials (O'Reilly XML) this publication consist a lot of the information in the condition of this
world now. This specific book was represented how does the world has grown up. The vocabulary styles that
writer make usage of to explain it is easy to understand. Typically the writer made some research when he
makes this book. Here is why this book suitable all of you.
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