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Bringing the material up to date to reflect modern applications, Algebraic Number Theory, Second Edition
has been completely rewritten and reorganized to incorporate a new style, methodology, and presentation.
This edition focuses on integral domains, ideals, and unique factorization in the first chapter; field extensions
in the second chapter; and class groups in the third chapter. Applications are now collected in chapter four
and at the end of chapter five, where primality testing is highlighted as an application of the
Kronecker–Weber theorem. In chapter five, the sections on ideal decomposition in number fields have been
more evenly distributed. The final chapter continues to cover reciprocity laws.

New to the Second Edition

Reorganization of all chapters●

More complete and involved treatment of Galois theory●

A study of binary quadratic forms and a comparison of the ideal and form class groups●

More comprehensive section on Pollard’s cubic factoring algorithm●

More detailed explanations of proofs, with less reliance on exercises, to provide a sound understanding of●

challenging material

The book includes mini-biographies of notable mathematicians, convenient cross-referencing, a
comprehensive index, and numerous exercises. The appendices present an overview of all the concepts used
in the main text, an overview of sequences and series, the Greek alphabet with English transliteration, and a
table of Latin phrases and their English equivalents.

Suitable for a one-semester course, this accessible, self-contained text offers broad, in-depth coverage of
numerous applications. Readers are lead at a measured pace through the topics to enable a clear
understanding of the pinnacles of algebraic number theory.
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From reader reviews:

Stanley Kamp:

Book is to be different for every single grade. Book for children until finally adult are different content. To
be sure that book is very important usually. The book Algebraic Number Theory, Second Edition (Discrete
Mathematics and Its Applications) has been making you to know about other know-how and of course you
can take more information. It is quite advantages for you. The reserve Algebraic Number Theory, Second
Edition (Discrete Mathematics and Its Applications) is not only giving you more new information but also to
get your friend when you feel bored. You can spend your own spend time to read your guide. Try to make
relationship using the book Algebraic Number Theory, Second Edition (Discrete Mathematics and Its
Applications). You never experience lose out for everything if you read some books.

John McDole:

Hey guys, do you would like to finds a new book to learn? May be the book with the subject Algebraic
Number Theory, Second Edition (Discrete Mathematics and Its Applications) suitable to you? The actual
book was written by famous writer in this era. The actual book untitled Algebraic Number Theory, Second
Edition (Discrete Mathematics and Its Applications)is the one of several books that will everyone read now.
This kind of book was inspired a lot of people in the world. When you read this reserve you will enter the
new way of measuring that you ever know previous to. The author explained their concept in the simple way,
and so all of people can easily to comprehend the core of this e-book. This book will give you a great deal of
information about this world now. To help you see the represented of the world within this book.

Jimmy Maiden:

The reason? Because this Algebraic Number Theory, Second Edition (Discrete Mathematics and Its
Applications) is an unordinary book that the inside of the guide waiting for you to snap this but latter it will
distress you with the secret that inside. Reading this book next to it was fantastic author who all write the
book in such remarkable way makes the content inside easier to understand, entertaining method but still
convey the meaning thoroughly. So , it is good for you for not hesitating having this nowadays or you going
to regret it. This phenomenal book will give you a lot of rewards than the other book have such as help
improving your expertise and your critical thinking means. So , still want to hold off having that book? If I
have been you I will go to the publication store hurriedly.

Houston Boynton:

Are you kind of active person, only have 10 or 15 minute in your morning to upgrading your mind talent or
thinking skill even analytical thinking? Then you are experiencing problem with the book when compared
with can satisfy your small amount of time to read it because this time you only find reserve that need more
time to be go through. Algebraic Number Theory, Second Edition (Discrete Mathematics and Its
Applications) can be your answer mainly because it can be read by you who have those short spare time



problems.
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