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With the publication of her novel Annie John in 1985, Jamaica Kincaid entered the ranks of the best novelists
of her generation. Her three autobiographical novels, Annie John,  Lucy, and Autobiography of My Mother,
and collection of short stories, At the Bottom of the River, touch on the universal theme of coming-of-age and
the female adolescent's need to sever her ties to her mother. This angst is couched in the social landscape of
post-colonial Antigua, a small Caribbean island whose legacy of racism affects Kincaid's protagonists. Her
fiction rewrites the history of the Caribbean from a West Indies perspective and this milieu colors the
experiences of her characters.

Following a biographical chapter, Paravisini-Gebert traces the development of Kincaid's craft as a writer.
Each of the novels and the collection of short stories is discussed in a separate chapter that includes sections
on plot, character, theme, and an alternate critical approach from which to read the novel, such as feminist. A
complete primary and secondary bibliography and lists of selected reviews of Kincaid's work complete the
study.
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From reader reviews:

Aaron Ryan:

Book is actually written, printed, or illustrated for everything. You can realize everything you want by a
publication. Book has a different type. As we know that book is important issue to bring us around the world.
Adjacent to that you can your reading skill was fluently. A guide Jamaica Kincaid: A Critical Companion
(Critical Companions to Popular Contemporary Writers) will make you to become smarter. You can feel a
lot more confidence if you can know about everything. But some of you think which open or reading any
book make you bored. It is not necessarily make you fun. Why they could be thought like that? Have you
trying to find best book or ideal book with you?

Michael Burr:

People live in this new morning of lifestyle always attempt to and must have the free time or they will get
wide range of stress from both lifestyle and work. So , whenever we ask do people have extra time, we will
say absolutely sure. People is human not really a huge robot. Then we question again, what kind of activity
are you experiencing when the spare time coming to anyone of course your answer will probably unlimited
right. Then ever try this one, reading ebooks. It can be your alternative inside spending your spare time, the
book you have read is usually Jamaica Kincaid: A Critical Companion (Critical Companions to Popular
Contemporary Writers).

Michael Hollinger:

Is it a person who having spare time and then spend it whole day simply by watching television programs or
just telling lies on the bed? Do you need something totally new? This Jamaica Kincaid: A Critical
Companion (Critical Companions to Popular Contemporary Writers) can be the answer, oh how comes? A
book you know. You are therefore out of date, spending your spare time by reading in this new era is
common not a geek activity. So what these books have than the others?

Anthony Bankston:

As a college student exactly feel bored to be able to reading. If their teacher expected them to go to the
library or to make summary for some guide, they are complained. Just very little students that has reading's
heart and soul or real their interest. They just do what the trainer want, like asked to the library. They go to at
this time there but nothing reading very seriously. Any students feel that studying is not important, boring
and also can't see colorful photographs on there. Yeah, it is to be complicated. Book is very important for
you personally. As we know that on this age, many ways to get whatever we really wish for. Likewise word
says, many ways to reach Chinese's country. Therefore , this Jamaica Kincaid: A Critical Companion
(Critical Companions to Popular Contemporary Writers) can make you experience more interested to read.
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