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Best known for evocative box-constructions in which he assembled small objects and ephemera, the
American surrealist Joseph Cornell (1903-72) was also a devoted fan of the cinema. He thrived on almost
daily visits to movie theaters, amassed archives of films and film stills, created short motion pictures, and
produced works honoring his favorite females movie stars. This book examines for the first time Cornell's
"portrait-homages" to these actresses, Hedy Lamarr, Lauren Bacall, Greta Garbo, and Jennifer Jones, among
others.Focusing on Cornell's "cinematic imagination" and the ways he adapted techniques of accumulation,
collection, and juxtaposition to the art of portrayal, Jodi Hauptman argues that Cornell's movie star portraits
are his most emblematic works. She shows how each portrait is inflicted by the star's personality, roles, and
the moment of a particular film's release and how Cornell ultimately transforms each of his subjects.
Hauptman also explores the links between collection and desire, contending that Cornell is both a surrealist
and a historian: his accumulation of cast-offs echoes surrealism's infatuation with the found object while his
attempts to rescue swiftly disappearing pasts reenact the historian's labor in the archive.
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From reader reviews:

Michelle Porter:

In this 21st centuries, people become competitive in most way. By being competitive right now, people have
do something to make all of them survives, being in the middle of the particular crowded place and notice by
means of surrounding. One thing that oftentimes many people have underestimated the idea for a while is
reading. Sure, by reading a guide your ability to survive raise then having chance to stand than other is high.
For yourself who want to start reading the book, we give you this particular Joseph Cornell: Stargazing in the
Cinema (Yale Publications in the History of Art) book as beginning and daily reading guide. Why, because
this book is greater than just a book.

Lisa Knight:

Your reading sixth sense will not betray a person, why because this Joseph Cornell: Stargazing in the
Cinema (Yale Publications in the History of Art) publication written by well-known writer who really knows
well how to make book which can be understand by anyone who all read the book. Written within good
manner for you, leaking every ideas and publishing skill only for eliminate your hunger then you still doubt
Joseph Cornell: Stargazing in the Cinema (Yale Publications in the History of Art) as good book not simply
by the cover but also with the content. This is one e-book that can break don't judge book by its handle, so do
you still needing another sixth sense to pick this specific!? Oh come on your studying sixth sense already
alerted you so why you have to listening to a different sixth sense.

Eugene Flowers:

The book untitled Joseph Cornell: Stargazing in the Cinema (Yale Publications in the History of Art) contain
a lot of information on the item. The writer explains the woman idea with easy means. The language is very
easy to understand all the people, so do not really worry, you can easy to read the item. The book was
authored by famous author. The author will bring you in the new period of time of literary works. It is easy
to read this book because you can read more your smart phone, or device, so you can read the book with
anywhere and anytime. In a situation you wish to purchase the e-book, you can start their official web-site in
addition to order it. Have a nice read.

Jacqueline Harding:

Don't be worry when you are afraid that this book will probably filled the space in your house, you may have
it in e-book way, more simple and reachable. This kind of Joseph Cornell: Stargazing in the Cinema (Yale
Publications in the History of Art) can give you a lot of pals because by you looking at this one book you
have thing that they don't and make you more like an interesting person. This particular book can be one of a
step for you to get success. This guide offer you information that probably your friend doesn't understand, by
knowing more than various other make you to be great individuals. So , why hesitate? We need to have
Joseph Cornell: Stargazing in the Cinema (Yale Publications in the History of Art).
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