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For sheer reading pleasure and fidelity to its source, this entirely new translation of Baudelaire’s magnum
opus is matchless. With admirable disregard for the fashionable cliché according to which poetry is
fundamentally “untranslatable,” Eric Gans works from the startling premise that the greatest French poet of
the nineteenth century can indeed be rendered in English without significant loss of meaning or effect. His
daring approach involves sticking as closely as possible to the French original, combining the translator’s
modesty with a remarkable poetic talent, in order to showcase not his own ingenuity but Baudelaire’s
distinctive vision. Poetry lovers and students of French literature alike will applaud the result.
Trevor Merrill, Lecturer in French, California Institute of Technology
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From reader reviews:

Lacey Clements:

In this 21st one hundred year, people become competitive in most way. By being competitive today, people
have do something to make all of them survives, being in the middle of often the crowded place and notice
by surrounding. One thing that oftentimes many people have underestimated it for a while is reading. Yeah,
by reading a reserve your ability to survive boost then having chance to stand than other is high. For you
personally who want to start reading the book, we give you that Les fleurs du mal: a new translation by Eric
Gans book as starter and daily reading reserve. Why, because this book is greater than just a book.

Leroy Ange:

Your reading 6th sense will not betray you, why because this Les fleurs du mal: a new translation by Eric
Gans guide written by well-known writer whose to say well how to make book that may be understand by
anyone who else read the book. Written within good manner for you, leaking every ideas and producing skill
only for eliminate your own hunger then you still skepticism Les fleurs du mal: a new translation by Eric
Gans as good book not simply by the cover but also with the content. This is one book that can break don't
evaluate book by its handle, so do you still needing one more sixth sense to pick this specific!? Oh come on
your reading sixth sense already said so why you have to listening to one more sixth sense.

Ollie Brooks:

As we know that book is essential thing to add our know-how for everything. By a book we can know
everything we wish. A book is a set of written, printed, illustrated or perhaps blank sheet. Every year had
been exactly added. This e-book Les fleurs du mal: a new translation by Eric Gans was filled in relation to
science. Spend your free time to add your knowledge about your research competence. Some people has
different feel when they reading some sort of book. If you know how big selling point of a book, you can
really feel enjoy to read a guide. In the modern era like at this point, many ways to get book that you simply
wanted.

Deanna Marcantel:

What is your hobby? Have you heard that question when you got learners? We believe that that issue was
given by teacher to their students. Many kinds of hobby, Everybody has different hobby. And you also know
that little person including reading or as reading through become their hobby. You should know that reading
is very important along with book as to be the matter. Book is important thing to provide you knowledge,
except your own personal teacher or lecturer. You discover good news or update with regards to something
by book. Numerous books that can you go onto be your object. One of them is niagra Les fleurs du mal: a
new translation by Eric Gans.
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