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Irony in Language and Thought assembles an interdisciplinary collection of seminal empirical and
theoretical papers on irony in language and thought into one comprehensive book. A much-needed resource
in the area of figurative language, this volume centers on a theme from cognitive science - that irony is a
fundamental way of thinking about the human experience. The editors lend perspective in the form of
opening and closing chapters, which enable readers to see how such works have furthered the field, as well
as to inspire present and future scholars.

Featured articles focus on the following topics:

theories of irony, addressing primarily comprehension of its verbal form●

context in irony comprehension●

social functions of irony●

the development of irony understanding●

situational irony.●

Scholars and students in psychology, linguistics, philosophy, literature, anthropology, artificial intelligence,
art, and communications will consider this book an excellent resource. It serves as an ideal supplement in
courses that present major ideas in language and thought.
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From reader reviews:

Catherine Crider:

Book will be written, printed, or created for everything. You can understand everything you want by a guide.
Book has a different type. We all know that that book is important matter to bring us around the world. Close
to that you can your reading skill was fluently. A e-book Irony in Language and Thought: A Cognitive
Science Reader will make you to always be smarter. You can feel a lot more confidence if you can know
about almost everything. But some of you think that will open or reading any book make you bored. It is far
from make you fun. Why they might be thought like that? Have you searching for best book or acceptable
book with you?

Allison Sala:

Reading a book can be one of a lot of task that everyone in the world enjoys. Do you like reading book
therefore. There are a lot of reasons why people like it. First reading a book will give you a lot of new info.
When you read a guide you will get new information because book is one of various ways to share the
information or their idea. Second, examining a book will make you actually more imaginative. When you
reading a book especially fiction book the author will bring one to imagine the story how the characters do it
anything. Third, it is possible to share your knowledge to others. When you read this Irony in Language and
Thought: A Cognitive Science Reader, you are able to tells your family, friends in addition to soon about
yours reserve. Your knowledge can inspire others, make them reading a book.

Calvin Lee:

The book Irony in Language and Thought: A Cognitive Science Reader has a lot info on it. So when you
check out this book you can get a lot of benefit. The book was authored by the very famous author. This
articles author makes some research prior to write this book. This particular book very easy to read you may
get the point easily after reading this article book.

Chris Holmes:

Irony in Language and Thought: A Cognitive Science Reader can be one of your starter books that are good
idea. Many of us recommend that straight away because this reserve has good vocabulary that can increase
your knowledge in language, easy to understand, bit entertaining but nevertheless delivering the information.
The writer giving his/her effort to get every word into delight arrangement in writing Irony in Language and
Thought: A Cognitive Science Reader yet doesn't forget the main point, giving the reader the hottest and also
based confirm resource info that maybe you can be one of it. This great information may drawn you into
brand-new stage of crucial imagining.
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